
$199,900 - 2112 Egret Street, Brunswick
MLS® #1653200 

$199,900
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,337 sqft
Residential on 0.25 Acres

Goodyear Park, Brunswick, GA

Welcome to this charming 3-bedroom,
2-bathroom brick home located in the heart of
Brunswick, just minutes from Southeast
Georgia Health System and the College of
Coastal Georgia. This residence offers
low-maintenance LVP flooring throughout, with
tile in the kitchen and bathrooms for added
durability and style. The kitchen features
stainless steel appliances. The primary suite is
a true retreat with dual closets, a relaxing
jacuzzi tub, and a separate tiled shower. Step
outside to a fully privacy-fenced backyard
complete with a workshopâ€”ideal for hobbies,
storage, or extra space. A convenient carport
adds to the functionality of this home, and with
**NO HOA**, youâ€™ll enjoy more freedom
and fewer restrictions. Don't miss this
opportunity to own a beautiful home in a prime
location!

Built in 1956

Essential Information

MLS® # 1653200

Price $199,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Full Baths 2

Square Footage 1,337

Acres 0.25

Year Built 1956



Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Community Information

Address 2112 Egret Street

Area B1: Brunswick

Subdivision Goodyear Park

City Brunswick

County Glynn

State GA

Zip Code 31520

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Available, Sewer Available, Sewer Connected

Parking Spaces 2

Parking Covered, Driveway, Garage, Kitchen Level, Paved, Rear/Side/Off Street

Interior

Interior Other, Tile

Appliances Dishwasher, Microwave, Oven, Range, Refrigerator, Some Electric
Appliances

Exterior

Exterior Features Paved Driveway, Porch

Construction Brick, Vinyl Siding

School Information

Elementary Goodyear

Middle Glynn Middle

High Brunswick High School

Additional Information

Date Listed April 12th, 2025

Days on Market 63

Listing Details

Listing Agent Leann Duckworth

Listing Office Duckworth Properties BWK
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